
 
APPLICATIONS DETERMINED BY DELEGATED POWERS 

 
 

APP NO. 
DATE REC’D 

NAME AND 
ADDRESS OF 
APPLICANT(S) 

PROPOSAL & LOCATION 
 

DECISION 
 

19/0091/FULL 
01.02.2019 

Greggs Plc 
Mrs S Humphries 
B3 Mucklestone 
Business Park 
Eccleshall Road 
Market Drayton 
Shropshire 
TF9 4FB 

Install two new air conditioning 
condenser units in a security 
cage and two extract grilles 
Castle View Shopping Centre 
(Unit C) Cae Meillion Caerphilly  

Granted 
09.05.2019 
 

19/0092/ADV 
01.02.2019 

Mrs S Humphries 
B3 Mucklestone 
Business Park 
Eccleshall Road 
Market Drayton 
Shropshire 
TF9 4FB 

Erect three fascia signs, two 
internal posters and two 
internal vinyl graphics 
Castle View Shopping Centre 
(Unit C) Cae Meillion Caerphilly  

Granted 
09.05.2019 
 

19/0189/FULL 
14.03.2019 

Mrs A Suri 
Ty Melyn 
113A St Martin's 
Road 
Caerphilly 
CF83 1EH 

Erect rear and first floor 
extension to provide manager's 
residential accommodation 
St Martin's Stores 115 St 
Martin's Road Caerphilly CF83 
1EH 

Granted 
09.05.2019 
 

19/0210/ADV 
14.03.2019 

Boots The Chemist 
Mr D Campbell 
D90 Thane Road  
Nottingham  
 

Install two new vinyl welcome 
panels to replace two existing 
in same location, new internally 
illuminated projecting sign 
replacing Boots lozenge and 
new side window vinyl to hide 
back of displays in window 
Boots The Chemists Ltd Unit 
12 Castle Court Caerphilly 

Granted 
09.05.2019 
 

19/0211/FULL 
14.03.2019 

Mr J Duggan 
28 Tir Bach Road 
Wyllie 
NP12 2HL 

Erect a garage and car port 
with all associated works 
28 Tir Bach Road Wyllie 
Blackwood NP12 2HL 

Granted 
10.05.2019 
 



 
19/0212/FULL 
14.03.2019 

Mr & Mrs Hall 
4 Llanddwyn Island 
Close 
Caerphilly 
CF83 2AS 
 

Erect first floor extension over 
an existing integrated garage, 
part conversion of garage, 
alterations to front parking area 
including creation of additional 
parking space and external 
alterations 
4 Llanddwyn Island Close 
Caerphilly CF83 2AS  

Granted 
10.05.2019 
 

19/0216/FULL 
15.03.2019 

Mr S Singh 
1 Jerusalem Street 
Rhymney 
Tredegar 
NP22 5JB 

Erect two storey rear extension 
10 Jerusalem Street Rhymney 
Tredegar NP22 5JB 

Refused 
10.05.2019 
 

19/0217/FULL 
15.03.2019 

Co-operative Group 
Mr L Fox 
C/o Swiss Post 
Solutions Ltd 
Unit 550 Metroplex 
Business Park 
Broadway 
Salford Quays 
Manchester 
M50 2UE 

Install an ATM machine 
through the shop front glazing 
and install plant to the rear of 
the building in existing timber 
fenced enclosure 
70 Commercial Road Machen   

Granted 
10.05.2019 
 

19/0218/FULL 
15.03.2019 

Mr J Franklin 
Garden Cottage 
Mount Pleasant 
Ynysddu 
Newport 
NP11 7JR 

Erect detached garage 
Garden Cottage Mount 
Pleasant Ynysddu Newport 

Granted 
10.05.2019 
 

19/0106/FULL 
08.02.2019 

Mr P Williams 
120 Derlwyn Street 
Phillipstown 
NP24 6BA 

Erect two storey side extension 
120 Derlwyn Street Phillipstown 
New Tredegar NP24 6BA 

Granted 
13.05.2019 
 

19/0158/FULL 
26.02.2019 

Miss E Templeman 
59 Park Place 
Risca 
NP11 6BN 

Erect two storey 
kitchen/bedroom extension, 
refurbishment works to property 
and development of roof space 
59 Park Place Pontymister 
Risca Newport 

Granted 
13.05.2019 
 

19/0219/FULL 
15.03.2019 

Marston's Estates Ltd 
Marston's House 
Brewery Road 
Wolverhampton 
WV1 4JT 
 

Erect a pub/restaurant (Class 
A3) with associated living 
accommodation, access, car 
parking and landscaping 
Land At Grid Ref 315158 
199420 Bargoed Gateway 
Bargoed  

Granted 
13.05.2019 
 



 
19/0285/NMA 
03.04.2019 

Mr L Ransys 
41 Coronation Road 
Blackwood 
NP12 1ED 

Seek approval of a non-
material amendment to 
planning consent 
15/0452/FULL (Construct a 
maisonette over an existing 
ground floor residential unit and 
erect a detached garage to 
rear), to change the window 
size to side elevation 
23A Oak Terrace Fleur-de-lis 
Blackwood NP12 3RW 

Granted 
13.05.2019 
 

19/0222/FULL 
19.03.2019 

Mrs S Choudhry 
48 Penylan Road 
Penylan 
Cardiff 
CF24 3PF 
 

Alterations to existing shop 
front to facilitate subdivision of 
existing shop (A1 Use) at 
ground floor level into 3 No. 
separate A1 retail units 
73 Cardiff Road Caerphilly   

Granted 
14.05.2019 
 

19/0223/FULL 
19.03.2019 

Mr & Mrs R Moger 
11 Cae Pen Y Waun 
Hengoed 
CF82 7RQ 

Erect a detached gymnasium 
room 
11 Cae Pen Y Waun Hengoed 
CF82 7RQ  

Granted 
14.05.2019 
 

19/0326/NMA 
15.04.2019 

Mrs J Randhawa 
Regi's  
9 & 10 Hanbury 
Road  
Bargoed  
CF81 8QS 

Seek approval of a non-
material amendment to 
planning consent 17/0424/COU 
(Change the use to mixed use 
retail/residential and provide 4 
no. flats and 1 no. maisonette 
with external alterations 
including new staircase, 
windows and doors) 
Regi's 9-10 Hanbury Road 
Bargoed CF81 8QS 

Refused 
14.05.2019 
 

19/0182/COND 
07.03.2019 

Mr R Brewer 
Lili Wen Farm 
Cilfynydd Road To 
Pant-Du Road 
Llanfabon 
CF37 4HN 
 

Discharge condition 08 
(Contamination - soil import 
testing) of planning consent 
17/0883/FULL (Develop an 
equine business and outdoor 
menage area of 40m x 30m) 
Lili Wen Farm Cilfynydd Road 
To Pant-Du Road Llanfabon 
Pontypridd 

Refused 
15.05.2019 
 

19/0197/FULL 
11.03.2019 

Miss H Wilson 
119 High Street 
Rhymney 
NP22 5NG 
 

Demolish the boundary wall to 
left and rear of the property and 
rebuild wall on a like for like 
basis 
119 High Street Rhymney 
Tredegar NP22 5NG 

Granted 
15.05.2019 
 



 
19/0198/CON 
11.03.2019 

Miss H Wilson 
119 High Street 
Rhymney 
NP22 5NG 

Demolish the boundary wall to 
left and rear of the property 
119 High Street Rhymney 
Tredegar NP22 5NG 

Granted 
15.05.2019 
 

19/0228/FULL 
20.03.2019 

Mr R Stevens 
37 Ffordd Erw 
Caerphilly 
CF83 1RY 
 

Erect a two storey side 
extension and single storey 
rear extension 
37 Ffordd Erw Caerphilly CF83 
1RY  

Granted 
15.05.2019 
 

19/0230/CLPU 
20.03.2019 

Mr H Griffiths 
4 Heol-Y-Cwm 
Watford 
Caerphilly 
CF83 1NN 

Obtain a Lawful Development 
Certificate for proposed single 
storey extension to the side 
and rear of dwelling and front 
porch 
4 Heol-Y-Cwm Watford 
Caerphilly CF83 1NN 

Granted 
15.05.2019 
 

19/0235/FULL 
22.03.2019 

Boots The Chemist 
Mr D Campbell 
D90 Thane Road  
Nottingham  

Install 1 No. new AC condenser 
to existing roof well 
Boots The Chemists Ltd Unit 
12 Castle Court Caerphilly 

Granted 
15.05.2019 
 

19/0237/COND 
22.03.2019 

Llanmoor 
Developments Ltd 
Mr S Grey  
63-65 Talbot Road 
Talbot Green 
Pontyclun 
Rhondda Cynon Taff 
CF72 8AE 
 

Discharge condition 10 
(Drainage) on planning consent 
18/1005/FULL (Erect 55 unit 
residential development with 
associated landscaping and 
play provision)  
Land At Former Bedwellty 
Comprehensive School  
Pengam Road Aberbargoed  

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
16.05.2019 
 

19/0239/COND 
22.03.2019 

Llanmoor 
Developments Ltd 
Mr S Grey 
63-65 Talbot Road 
Talbot Green 
Pontyclun 
Rhondda Cynon Taff 
CF72 8AE 

Discharge condition 11 
(Contamination - scheme to 
treat) of planning consent 
18/1005/FULL (Erect 55 unit 
residential development with 
associated landscaping and 
play provision) 
Land At Former Bedwellty 
Comprehensive School  
Pengam Road Aberbargoed  

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
16.05.2019 
 

19/0334/NOTA 
18.04.2019 

Mr I Davies 
Bedlwyn Farm 
Cefn-Rhychdir Road 
Phillipstown 
New Tredegar 
NP24 6BT 

Erect hay barn and machinery 
store 
Bedlwyn Farm Cefn-Rhychdir 
Road Phillipstown New 
Tredegar 

Prior Approval 
Not Required 
16.05.2019 
 



 
19/0186/FULL 
07.03.2019 

Mr & Mrs Abraham 
16 Pentland Close 
Trenewydd Park 
Risca 
NP11 6QU 

Remove existing dormer and 
erect new dormers to front and 
rear 
16 Pentland Close Trenewydd 
Park Risca Newport 

Granted 
17.05.2019 
 

19/0234/FULL 
22.03.2019 

Mr D Shaw 
17 Napier Street 
Machen 
CF83 8PR 
 

Remove existing parking 
provision to rear of property 
and replace with a detached 
garage 
17 Napier Street Machen 
Caerphilly CF83 8PR 

Granted 
17.05.2019 
 

19/0250/TPO 
22.03.2019 

Mr B Herbert 
Llanarth Estate 
Office  
Llanarth  
Raglan  
Usk  
Monmouthshire  
NP15 2YB 

Carry out various works to 
trees (Tree Preservation Order 
47/70/MCC) 
Land At Grid Ref 321550 
198032 - Crumlin Woodland 
Old Pant Road Pantside  

Granted 
17.05.2019 
 

19/0178/FULL 
05.03.2019 

Mrs K Nolan-Rice 
3 Woodland Rise 
Deri 
Bargoed 
CF81 9JF 

Install an extra bedroom 
window on side elevation 
3 Woodland Rise Deri Bargoed 
CF81 9JF 

Granted 
20.05.2019 
 

19/0231/COND 
21.03.2019 

Mr M Thompson 
7 Gelliargwellt Road 
Penybryn 
Hengoed 
CF82 7FZ 
 

Discharge conditions 03 (slab 
levels), 08 (land drainage), 16 
(reptile survey), 17 (bat roost) 
and 18 (breeding birds) of 
planning consent 
17/0788/FULL (Erect detached 
house and integral garage) 
Land Between 75-77 Upper 
Road (Grid Ref 315409 
202062) Elliots Town New 
Tredegar 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
21.05.2019 
 

19/0248/FULL 
25.03.2019 

Mr & Mrs D Rees 
7 Llanarth Square 
Pontymister 
Risca 
NP11 6EA 
 

Conversion of existing integral 
garage to lounge, single storey 
flat roof extension to rear and 
detached garage 
7 Llanarth Square Pontymister 
Risca Newport 

Granted 
21.05.2019 
 

19/0251/FULL 
26.03.2019 

Mrs T Jones 
4 Hafod-Fach View 
High Meadow 
Abercarn 
NP11 5AF 

Erect detached single garage 
4 Hafod-fach View High 
Meadow Abercarn Newport 

Granted 
21.05.2019 
 



 
19/0261/FULL 
26.03.2019 

Mr C Blakemore 
6 Gelli Lane  
Pontllanfraith  
Blackwood 
NP12 2JR 

Erect a single storey extension 
and front porch 
6 Gelli Lane Pontllanfraith 
Blackwood NP12 2JR 

Granted 
21.05.2019 
 

19/0154/ADV 
14.03.2019 

Glofa Trust 
Mrs V Jenkins 
Albany House 
Gladstone Road 
Crumlin 
NP11 5EN 

Display white letters on black 
half of pit wheel 
Land At Grid Ref 321245 
198472 Load Of Hay Road 
Crumlin  

Granted 
22.05.2019 
 

19/0337/NMA 
18.04.2019 

TWT Limited 
C/o Boyer 
Mr J Davies 
Third Floor 
Park House 
Greyfriars Road 
Cardiff 
CF10 3AF 
 

Seek approval of a non-
material amendment to 
planning consent 
17/0256/FULL (Erect a 
warehouse/light industrial 
building (Use classes B1 and 
B8) to make alterations to 
elevations during construction 
Land Within Curtilage Of XPO 
Transport Solutions UK Limited 
Unit A Distribution Way 

Granted 
22.05.2019 
 

18/0616/FULL 
09.07.2018 

Mrs J Thomas 
Caerllwyn Ganol 
Farm 
Twyn-gwyn Road 
Mynyddislwyn 
NP11 5JY 

Convert sixteen stables into 
four one bedroom holiday 
chalets 
Caerllwyn Ganol Farm Twyn-
gwyn Road Mynyddislwyn 
Newport 

Granted 
23.05.2019 
 

18/0907/FULL 
17.10.2018 

Mrs M Roberts 
86 Heol-Y-Ddol 
Caerphilly 
CF83 3JN 

Erect bungalow 
Land At Grid Ref 315569 
188254 Heol-Y-Ddol Caerphilly  

Granted 
23.05.2019 
 

19/0099/FULL 
06.02.2019 

Mr & Mrs Hopkins 
3 Vale View 
Tabor Road 
Maesycwmmer 
CF82 7PW 
 

Erect two storey side extension 
with single storey portion to 
rear, single storey extension to 
front elevation, driveway 
alterations to provide additional 
off-road parking and retaining 
walls with balustrading over, 
stone wall with iron railings 
over and install electric gate 
3 Vale View Tabor Road 
Maesycwmmer Hengoed 

Granted 
23.05.2019 
 

18/1032/FULL 
04.12.2018 

Mr & Mrs S Harris 
Alderwood 
High Street 
Ynysddu 
NP11 7JH 

Erect single storey extensions 
to rear and side 
Martindale Pennar Lane 
Pentwyn-mawr Newport 

Granted 
24.05.2019 
 



19/0202/TPO 
07.03.2019 

Mr G Holder 
27 Kingswood Close 
Hengoed 
CF82 7LU 

Remove Yew tree (Tree 
Preservation Order 
49/82/RVDC) 
Land To The Rear Of 27 
Kingswood Close Hengoed 
CF82 7LU 

Granted 
24.05.2019 
 

19/0252/NOTA 
26.03.2019 

Mr J Parker 
12 Clos Mabon 
Rhiwbina 
Cardiff 
CF14 6RN 

Re-profile/fill of boggy ground, 
to bring back into beneficial use 
Land At Grid Ref 315956 
184975 Cefn Carnau Lane 
Thornhill Caerphilly 

Not Permitted 
Development 
24.05.2019 
 

19/0283/FULL 
02.04.2019 

Mr & Mrs Crean 
70 Hazel Grove 
Caerphilly 
CF83 3BP 

Erect single storey annexe to 
front 
70 Hazel Grove Caerphilly 
CF83 3BP  

Granted 
24.05.2019 
 

18/1012/FULL 
26.11.2018 

Mr N Jones 
1 Redbrook Court  
St Martin's Road 
Caerphilly 
CF83 1ED 

Erect first floor extension over 
existing garage and utility room 
(revised scheme) 
1 Redbrook Court  St Martin's 
Road Caerphilly CF83 1ED 

Granted 
28.05.2019 
 

19/0214/FULL 
14.03.2019 

Mrs L Burrows 
54 Bryncelyn 
Nelson 
CF46 6HN 

Erect single storey extension to 
side and rear and front porch 
54 Bryncelyn Nelson Treharris 
CF46 6HN 

Granted 
28.05.2019 
 

19/0236/COND 
22.03.2019 

Llanmoor 
Developments Ltd 
Mr S Grey 
63-65 Talbot Road 
Talbot Green 
Pontyclun 
Rhondda Cynon Taff 
CF72 8AE 

Discharge conditions 6 
(Construction - engineering 
details), 9 (Improved access), 
25 (Access to playing fields) 
and 28 (Light mitigation 
strategy) of planning consent 
18/1005/FULL (Erect 55 unit 
residential development with 
associated landscaping and 
play provision) 
Land At Former Bedwellty 
Comprehensive School  
Pengam Road Aberbargoed   

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
28.05.2019 
 

19/0243/COND 
22.03.2019 

Mr & Mrs R Cleaver 
Gwaun-y-bara House 
Pentwyngwyn Road 
Rudry 
Caerphilly 
CF83 3DG 
 

Discharge conditions 3 (window 
and door plans) and  4 
(materials) of planning consent 
18/0299/FULL (Erect single 
storey extension to side of 
existing house) 
Gwaun-y-bara House 
Pentwyngwyn Road Rudry 
Caerphilly 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
28.05.2019 
 



 
19/0280/FULL 
01.04.2019 

Mr Cook 
6 Haford Tudor 
Terrace 
Wattsville 
Newport 
NP11 7QQ 

Construct a single-storey 
garage with storage in the loft 
6 Hafod Tudor Terrace 
Wattsville Newport NP11 7QQ 

Granted 
28.05.2019 
 

19/0282/TPO 
02.04.2019 

Mr S Perry 
Glenside 
Summerfield Hall 
Lane 
Maesycwmmer 
Hengoed 
CF82 7RG 

Carry out various tree works 
(Tree Preservation Order 
76/73/MCC) 
Brooklands Summerfield Hall 
Lane Maesycwmmer Hengoed 

Granted 
28.05.2019 
 

18/0705/COU 
03.08.2018 

Ms K Watkins 
The Meadows 
Gypsy Lane 
Groeswen 
CF15 7UN 

Change the use of existing 
offices/garage building to new 
office space on first floor and 
activity rooms on the ground 
floor 
The Meadows Gypsy Lane 
Groeswen CF15 7UN 

Granted 
29.05.2019 
 

18/1009/RM 
26.11.2018 

Charles Barclay 
Homes 
Mr D Gill 
Regent Building 
North Road 
Newbridge 
Newport 
NP11 4AB 

Seek approval of the reserved 
matters regarding details of 
access, appearance, 
landscaping, layout and scale 
in relation to planning consent 
14/0239/NCC (Vary condition 3 
of 09/0688/OUT (Erect 
residential development) to 
extend the time period for the 
approval of reserved matters) 
Land At Grid Ref 320738 
198125 Albertina Road 
Treowen  

Granted 
30.05.2019 
 

19/0288/FULL 
04.04.2019 

Mr M Garrett 
17 Shirdale Close 
Maesycwmmer 
Hengoed 
CF82 7QL 
 

Erect a single storey kitchen 
extension to side and front of 
dwelling 
17 Shirdale Close 
Maesycwmmer Hengoed CF82 
7QL 

Refused 
30.05.2019 
 

19/0292/FULL 
04.04.2019 

Ms S Alick 
1 Brynhyfryd 
Bedwas 
Caerphilly 
CF83 8AZ 

Erect a two storey extension to 
side and a single storey to the 
rear of the property 
1 Brynhyfryd Bedwas 
Caerphilly CF83 8AZ 

Granted 
30.05.2019 
 



 
19/0294/COU 
04.04.2019 

Mr C Simmonds 
35 Nine Mile Point 
Wattsville 
Newport 
NP11 7QP 

Change the use from B1 to a 
distillery 
All Seasons Blinds Unit Q 
Caerphilly Business Park 
Caerphilly 

Granted 
30.05.2019 
 

19/0259/COND 
25.03.2019 

Bethany Baptist 
Church 
Tredegar Street 
Risca 
Newport 
NP11 6BW 

Partially discharge condition 03 
(Replacement roof details) of 
planning consent 13/0080/LBC 
(Provide internal alterations 
and re-roofing) 
Bethany Baptist Church 
Tredegar Street Risca Newport 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
03.06.2019 
 

19/0270/FULL 
29.03.2019 

D Davies 
Car Park  
Technology Park 
Newbridge 
NP11 5AN 

Erect security palisade fencing 
Car Park Technology Park 
Newbridge  

Granted 
03.06.2019 
 

19/0274/COND 
29.03.2019 

Mr D Parfitt 
The Firs 
Royal Oak 
Machen 
Caerphilly 
CF83 8SN 
 

Discharge conditions 3 
(Materials of retaining wall) and 
5 (Contamination - soil import 
testing) of planning consent 
18/0335/FULL (Construct first 
floor extension over existing 
garage, create new 
porch/access corridor, new 
front door access steps along 
with a boundary retaining wall) 
The Firs Royal Oak Machen 
Caerphilly 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
03.06.2019 
 

19/0293/FULL 
05.04.2019 

Mrs S Davies 
5 Clos Dwyerw 
Caerphilly 
CF83 1TE 
 

Demolish existing conservatory 
and erect full width single 
storey dual pitch gable 
kitchen/diner extension 
5 Clos Dwyerw Caerphilly 
CF83 1TE  

Granted 
03.06.2019 
 

19/0298/FULL 
05.04.2019 

Mr P Mason 
70 Cwm Braenar 
Pontllanfraith 
Blackwood 
NP12 2DS 

Erect two storey rear extension 
for dining room and bedroom 
70 Cwm Braenar Pontllanfraith 
Blackwood NP12 2DS 

Granted 
03.06.2019 
 



 
18/1063/FULL 
17.12.2018 

Miss Harvey 
15 Willow Park 
Croespenmaen 
NP11 3LS 
 

Demolish existing garage and 
replace with new two bed 
dwelling and provide two 
parking spaces to the front of 
the new dwelling and two 
parking spaces to the front of 
the existing dwelling 
15 Willow Park Croespenmaen 
Newport NP11 3LS 

Granted 
04.06.2019 
 

19/0020/FULL 
09.01.2019 

Miss P Watts 
19 Pine Grove 
Ystrad Mynach 
Hengoed 
CF82 7DS 

Erect single and two storey 
extensions to rear and remove 
chimney 
19 Pine Grove Ystrad Mynach 
Hengoed CF82 7DS 

Granted 
04.06.2019 
 

19/0152/COU 
25.02.2019 

Mrs J Hasler 
C/o Fine Design 
Conservation 
Croes Hywell 
Old Monmouth Road 
Of 
Symonds Yat 
Abergavenny 
NP7 8BS 

Change the use from three flats 
to single C3 dwelling for a 
maximum of 6 persons living as 
a single family 
8-10 School Street Elliot's 
Town New Tredegar  

Granted 
04.06.2019 
 

19/0170/FULL 
04.03.2019 

Mr P Graham 
Rose Cottage 
5 The Row 
Draethen 
Newport 
NP10 8GD 
 

Demolish existing unlisted 
single storey rear lean-to 
structure and erect enlarged 
replacement single storey rear 
extension with associated 
alteration works 
Rose Cottage 5 The Row 
Draethen Newport 

Granted 
04.06.2019 
 

19/0208/COND 
12.03.2019 

Ludlow Street 
Investment 
Corporation 
Mr Griffiths 
5th Floor 
Harlech Court 
Bute Terrace 
Cardiff 
CF10 2FE 

Discharge condition 06 (Land 
Drainage) of planning consent 
18/0293/FULL (Erect 
agricultural barn and a timber 
animal field shelter on an 
existing hardstanding) 
Cefn Carnau Uchaf Farm Cefn 
Carnau Lane Thornhill 
Caerphilly 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
04.06.2019 
 

19/0253/FULL 
26.03.2019 

Mr & Mrs Roderick 
29 Wyndham Street 
Machen 
Caerphilly 
CF83 8PU 
 

Erect single storey side/rear 
extension, alter rear ground 
levels and create new patio and 
steps 
29 Wyndham Street Machen 
Caerphilly CF83 8PU 

Granted 
04.06.2019 
 



 
19/0278/FULL 
01.04.2019 

McDonald's 
Restaurants Ltd 
11-59 High Road 
East Finchley 
London 
N2 8AW 
 

Alter the drive thru lane to 
accommodate side-by-side 
ordering with the introduction of 
an island for signage and 
associated works changes to 
the back of house with the 
existing corral reconfigured 
incorporating an extended store 
room (5 sqm) and additional 
roof panels to match existing 
installation of a new Customer 
Order Display (COD) and 
overhead canopy and the 
relocation of the existing unit 
and introduction of a Goal Post 
height restrictor 
McDonalds Restaurants Ltd 
Unit 2 Newbridge Gateway 
Bridge Street 

Granted 
04.06.2019 
 

19/0279/ADV 
01.04.2019 

McDonalds 
Restaurants Ltd 
11-59 High Road 
East Finchley 
N2 8AW 
 

Erect digital signage with 
retention and relocation of 
existing signs, suite to 
comprise; 4 No. Freestanding 
signs and 1 No. Banner sign 
McDonalds Restaurants Ltd 
Unit 2 Newbridge Gateway 
Bridge Street 

Granted 
04.06.2019 
 



 
19/0297/COND 
05.04.2019 

C/O Agent 
 

Discharge condition 12, 
working method statement 17, 
construction traffic 
management plan of planning 
consent 17/1027/FULL 
(Demolish Caerphilly 
Magistrates' Court building and 
re-develop with 38 No. 
dwellings (comprising 34 No. 
apartments and a terrace of 4 
No. houses), together with 
associated vehicular and 
pedestrian accesses, car 
parking, amenity areas, buggy 
and bin store, landscaping and 
ancillary development: site 
preparation, clearance, 
treatment, re-profiling and the 
installation of new services and 
infrastructure) Caerphilly 
Magistrates Court  Mountain 
Road Caerphilly CF83 1HG 

Decided - 
Discharge of 
Conditions 
04.06.2019 
 

19/0300/FULL 
05.04.2019 

Mr R A O Keefe 
3 Coundley Close  
Fleur-de-Lis 
Blackwood  
NP12 3TS 

Erect a ground floor side 
extension 
3 Coundley Close Fleur-de-lis 
Blackwood NP12 3TS 

Granted 
04.06.2019 
 

19/0304/FULL 
09.04.2019 

Mr C Tipples 
19 Central Street 
Ystrad Mynach 
Hengoed 
CF82 7EN 

Erect two storey extension to 
rear of property 
19 Central Street Ystrad 
Mynach Hengoed CF82 7EN 

Granted 
04.06.2019 
 

19/0224/FULL 
19.03.2019 

Lush Property 
Management Ltd 
12 Ffordd Las 
Abertridwr 
Caerphilly 
CF83 4EW 

Raise ridge height of existing 
dwelling, external alterations, 
rear first floor balcony and 
internal remodelling 
12 Ffordd Las Abertridwr 
Caerphilly CF83 4EW 

Granted 
06.06.2019 
 

19/0240/FULL 
22.03.2019 

Mrs L Krizan 
5 Ynys-Glyd Street 
Ystrad Mynach 
Hengoed 
CF82 7ET 

Erect a part single storey, part 
two storey rear extension 
5 Ynys-Glyd Street Ystrad 
Mynach Hengoed CF82 7ET 

Granted 
06.06.2019 
 



 
19/0267/FULL 
29.03.2019 

Mr L James 
Duffryn Isaf 
Duffryn Terrace 
Wattsville 
Crosskeys 
Newport 
NP11 7QN 

Erect detached dwelling and 
detached garage 
Land Within The Curtilage Of 
Dan-y-coed Glanhowy Road 
Wyllie Blackwood 

Granted 
06.06.2019 
 

19/0309/COU 
10.04.2019 

Butcher And Ball Dog 
Cafe 
Mrs C Ball  
C/o Brinsons Estate 
Agents & Chartered 
Surveyors  
Market Street  
Caerphilly  
CF83 1NX 

Change the use from A1/A2 to 
A3 class 
8 St Fagans Street Caerphilly 
CF83 1FZ  

Granted 
06.06.2019 
 

 
 
 
 


